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REPORT OF THE PROGRAMME 

Kalyanimahavidyalaya, nss unit 

SWACHHA PAKHWADA PROGEAMME-2017 

(1st September, 2017 to 15th September,2017) 

NSS Unit of KalyaniMahavidyalaya has celebrated „SWACHTTA PAKHWADA‟ 

programme from 1st September to 15th September, 2017 in the college premises. The main 
objective of this programme was to keep clean our college with the surrounding area and to 
spread the message among students and their society. To achieve this goal, 50 young 
energetic NSS volunteers have started their fifteen day‟s journey by celebrating campus 

cleaning day on 1st September, 2017. 

1ST September, 2017 

Programme: Campus cleaning 

The programme started at 11a.m. At first, all necessary equipmentshave been distributed 
among volunteers. Then, NSS volunteers have cleaned the college ground very well. Then 
they have spread bleaching power near the college boundary wall.  Volunteers have done 
their cleaning work under the supervision of six teachers of the college. The whole 
programme has completed within four hours.  

2nd September, 2017 (Class room cleaning) 

In the second day,  NSS unit has celebrated „Classroom Cleaning day‟ where the main 

objective was to keep clean the entire classroom of the college. As we have no any hostel 
facilities in the college premises, so NSS took the programme of cleaning up the classroom in 
the place of hostel cleaning programme. NSS volunteers were working actively in the 
leadership of two NSS supervisors. They have started the work at 11.30 a.m and completed at 
3.45 p.m. The volunteers have cleaned 40 classrooms in the college building. 

 
3rd September, 2017 (Green campus) 

In the 3rd day, NSS Unit of KalyaniMahavidyalaya has celebrated „Green Campus Day‟. The 

main objective of this programme was to promote sustainable development. Dr. Runu Das, 
Principal of KalyaniMahavidyalaya, was present as a resource person of the programme. This 
programme has started at 10.a.m. A tree plantation festival has organized by NSS unit in the 
presence of Principal, Programme officer, other teachers and students. Volunteers also put 
fence and poured water the plants. Total 35 trees have planted by NSS Volunteers in the 
college ground. 

4th September, 2017 (Canteen cleaning) 



In the fourth day of this programme. NSS unit has celebrated „Canteen Cleaning day‟ where 

the main objective was to keep clean college kitchen and canteen. As the college have no 
mess facility NSS took the programme of cleaning up the college canteen in the place of 
mess. NSS volunteers were working actively in the leadership of two NSS supervisors. They 
have started their work at 10.30 a.m and completed at 2.00 p.m.  

5th September, 2017 (Essay Contest) 

NSS Unit, KalyaniMahavidyalaya has organized an Essay Contest in the fifth day of this 
programme. The topic was „Innovative ways for spreading the message of Hygiene. In this 

contest, there was 30 participants from different stream of students. Three teachers have 
conducted the contest. NSS volunteers has provides all the necessary arrangement. Dr. 
Kusumita Mukherjee was the judge of this contest. And she finally selected 1st, 2nd& 3rd 
winner of the essay contest. 

6th September, 2017 (Road Cleaning Day) 

According to the pre-planned schedule, NSS Unit has celebrated Road Cleaning Day in 6th 
September. The main objective of this programme was to keep clean our roads with the 
surrounding area of college. To achieve this goal, 75 NSS volunteers have participated in this 
road cleaning programme. The programme started at 11a.m. At first, all necessary 
equipments have distributed among volunteers. Then, NSS volunteers have swept the college 
road and surroundings area. There were 7 teachers with NSS programme officer for supervise 
the work. The whole programme has completed within four hours 

7th September.2017 (Cleaning training) 

In the 7th day, NSS Unit has organized a training programme on „Garbage Cleaning System‟. 

There was one invitee trainer for this training programme on „Garbage Cleaning System‟. At 

first, trainer presented a wonderful power point presentation on the selected subject. Then the 
trainer trained the present volunteers and students in real situation. 

8th September,2017 (Wall Writing) 

In 8th September, NSS volunteers has celebrated another programme of „Care for the 

surroundings‟. At 10 a.m volunteers start their journey for this programme. They have 
selected a far village, Iswaripur and went there early morning. Volunteers have visited door 
to door to send message about the need of cleanliness. They also distribute leaflets among 
villagers. Then the volunteers have started their next programme, wall writing. Four NSS 
volunteers have wrote the Swachhata related message on the wall for increasing awareness 
among the villagers. 

9th September,2017 (Market survey) 

In 9th day, a market survey has conducted by NSS volunteers to know the system of cleaning. 
The programme has started at 9a.m. 2no Market, Kalyani, was selected for this work. All the 
volunteers have visited the whole market under the supervision of four teachers and collected 



data from 50 shopkeeper of this market. After data collection, volunteers have analyzed data 
and revealed their findings. In market area solid waste is left on open land or dumped near the 
market on the road side. The food scraps, papers and plastic bags present on market waste 
create unpleasant odors and spread different diseases, like malaria. The solid waste 
management system of Kalyani B-2 Market was surveyed by NSS volunteers. One 
questionnaire consists of 20 items was formed to know the overall system of the B-2 market 
cleaning process. Kalyani municipality collects the garbage from the market area daily. Most 
of the shops (48) are satisfied with the service provided by the Kalyani Municipality. Two 
shop owners complained that if the municipality sweeper is absent the collection process is 
hampered. This situation deteriorates during the rainy season and the whole market area goes 
under six inches rainwater. Five shop owners remarked that there is need for more dust bins 
in this market area. The clay model shops (2) recycle their waste products, paper, carton, 
plastic bags, bottles, food waste, tins, cans, broke glass are the main types of waste materials 
in this area. The Market committee of this area tries to spread consciousness about the 
drawbacks of using plastic bags less than 40 microns thickness in the monthly meetings 
among the shopkeepers. Most of the public bins in the market area are in good state. All the 
shop owners are agreed to separate materials in different bags if Kalyani Municipality 
organizes a recycling programme in this market area. 

10th September, 2017. (Hospital survey) 

In 10th September, a hospital survey was conducted by the NSS volunteers.50 volunteers and 
4 teachers have participated in this programme. At 11 a.m. they have reached in the JNM 
hospital and met with the superintended and assistant superintended of this hospital. They 
have arranged all the set up. They divided all volunteers into 5 groups and send them to visit 
the cleaning system of the hospital under the supervision of 5 nurses. They have also 
arranged a demonstration for the volunteers. 

11th September, 2017 (Visit Orphanage home) 

In the 11th day, all the volunteers of NSS, have visited an Orphanage home (Address-Gaguli, 
kappa more. )to make aware about cleanliness among orphan children. We have selected an 
Orphanage home, “Familia” near Jagulia. We have hired a bus to reach the Orphanage home. 

There are 63 orphan children in different ages. NSS volunteers have arranged a programme 
for the children. Students volunteers perform various song, dance, drama relating to 
Swachhata to make conscious about cleanliness among children. Then the volunteers also 
distributes necessary materials of cleaning like- Soap, Hand wash, harpic, finayel, detol, 
bleaching power, karbolic acid etc. 

12th September, 2017 (Seminar) 

NSS Unit of KalyaniMahavidyalaya has arranged a debriefing session on „Cleanliness‟ with 

the local body of municipality at the college premises on 12th September, 2017.  The main 
objective of this programme was to make aware about swachhata among students. To achieve 
this goal, 100 young energetic NSS volunteers organized one day seminar on “Cleanliness”. 

Sri SushilTalukder, chairman of Kalyani municipality, Dr. SukhenBiswas, NSS co-



ordinatorof Kalyani University and Dr. NiladriBiswas, Project Officer, of Kalyani University, 
was present as resource persons, who delivered their valuable speech for students to give 
message on cleanliness. All teachers, non-teaching staff & students of 
KalyaniMahavidyalaya, were participated in this programme. 

 

13th September, 2017 (Contest of cleaning) 

In 13th day, NSS Unit have organized a “cleaning contest” in the college building. This 

programmes was full of enjoyment for the students. At first, NSS volunteers divided all the 
participants into 11 team (4 team member in each team) and provide the necessary materials 
for cleaning to each group. A lottery was conducted for room distribution. Then the 
participants group have started their contest. There are two judges for selecting the winner 
team. 

14th September, 2017 (Elocution contest) 

NSS Unit, KalyaniMahavidyalaya has organized an “Elocution Contest” in the fourteenth day 

of this programme. In this contest, there was 18 participants from different stream of 
students. One teacher has conducted the contest. There are three judges for selection of 
winner. Participants have provided separate topic related to cleanliness.  NSS volunteers has 
provides all the necessary arrangement. And finally the judges selected 1st, 2nd& 3rd winner of 
the Elocution contest. 

15th September, 2017 (Prize distribution) 

The programme of the last day that means 15th day was prize distribution. All NSS volunteers 
organized a programme. In this programme, they arranged a quiz competition for the non-
teaching staff of the college, relating to cleanliness, health & hygiene. Then the prizes are 
distributed by our Principal madam and other teachers among the winners of essay contest, 
cleaning contest, elocution contest, quiz contest. And, finally we have finished our 15 days 
programme successfully. 



 

 



 
 

 

 


